
31/03/23 19.13Yahoo Mail - Re: Journal Publication

Page 1 of 3https://mail.yahoo.com/d/search/keyword=RHSS%2520no.%25204%25…f97A6B8IcpN7P5n1D1GqDurQusIF1JIrjoIRvl56-q1muqzOg6i7s80miVJE

Re: Journal Publication

From: IISTE-Journal of Research on Humanities and Social Sciences (rhss@iiste.org)

To: rr_nanik_setyowati@yahoo.com

Date: Wednesday, 10 February 2016 at 09:03 PM GMT+7

Thanks.

The article will be published on February 29th.

Best regards,

On Wed, Feb 10, 2016 at 1:02 PM, Rr Nanik Setyowati <rr_nanik_setyowati@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear,

attached proof of payment receipts, please welcome

Regards,

Rr. Nanik S
On Tuesday, 9 February 2016, 20:13, IISTE-Journal of Research on Humanities and Social Sciences
<RHSS@iiste.org> wrote:

Hi Rr Nanik Setyowati,

It's nearest time is the February edition. To be publish it, you need to send me the
publication charge receipt.

Thanks,

On Tue, Feb 9, 2016 at 6:29 PM, Rr Nanik Setyowati
<rr_nanik_setyowati@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear,

I send CopyRight Agreement attached that had been signed.
when my article will be published? I chose cost USD.185 (online publication + 3 hard copies).
Explanation please.

Regards

Rr. Nanik S.

On Wednesday, 3 February 2016, 10:41, IISTE-Journal of Research on Humanities and Social
Sciences <RHSS@iiste.org> wrote:

Dear Rr. Nanik S,

It's confirmed publishable.  Could you please finalize the publication charge as
soon as possible? 
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Thanks,

On Wed, Feb 3, 2016 at 2:24 PM, Rr Nanik Setyowati
<rr_nanik_setyowati@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear,

I attach the following journal article that I adjust to the template format you requested
I wait for the follow-up

Regards

Rr. Nanik S

On Wednesday, 3 February 2016, 4:27, IISTE-Journal of Research on Humanities and Social
Sciences <RHSS@iiste.org> wrote:

Dear Rr. Nanik Setyowati

I hope you are doing well recently.  Thanks for submitting the new article "IMPACT OF
CORPORATE SOCIAL RESPONSIBILITY PROGRAM....."

We trust your recommendation and would like to publish the article.  Could you please prepare the
documents required based on the instruction file attached as you did last time? 

Thanks and I look forward to your update.

Sincerely, 
Editorial Team

On Wed, Feb 3, 2016 at 12:20 AM, Rr Nanik Setyowati
<rr_nanik_setyowati@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear,
I sent the attached paper, please welcome and can be entered as a journal
publication again. Thank you.

Regards

Rr. Nanik Setyowati
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